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41522, 2:.00 PM Pilson Auto Center Mail - Re: Pilson Auto Center

; el S o b Todd Kresin <tkresingipiisonauto.coms
auTo CENTER

Re: Pilson Auto Center

1 message
Morgan Withee <morgan@impactpays.com> Maon, Mar 28, 2022 at 2:12 PM
To: Todd Kresin <tkresin@pilsenauto.com>

Ce: Clint Cribbet <ceribbet@pilsonauto.com:=

Hey Todd,

That is great news! | have looked over your file and the only thing | need for your new application is a copy of a voided check or bank letter. For the setup for the ford
store | just need to know how many ferminals you will need there.

Looking forward lo getting you all set up on the Valor system.

Have a great day!

Hasi Heg

jargds,

Morgan Withee
VI of Operations

T: (S01) 601-0032
M: (501) 692-4540
E: morgan@impactpays.com

PAYSYBTEM

Impact PaySystems| Impact Payment Partners
1164 Vickery Lane Suite 200 Cordova, TN 38016

The information contained in this message is proprietary and/or confidential. If you are not the intended recipicnt, please: {i} deiete the message and al}
copies; (i) do not disclose, distribute or use the message in any manner; and (ili) notify the sender immediately. In addition, please be aware that any
message addressed fo our dornain is subject to archiving and review by persons other than the intended recipient. Thank you.

On Mon, Mar 28, 2022 at 1:07 PM Todg Kresin <tkresin@pilsonauto.com> wrote:
! Morgan,
- we want 10 go with the Valor terminals, Neil wanted me te contact you, can we do the ford store first? Let us know what you need.
- thanks
todd

Todd Kresin
Dan Pifsan Auto Center, Inc.
Mattoon, H. 61938

| 217-238-6748

- tkresin@plsonauto.com
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